BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFEIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTORN & HOVE VARICUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.8 2010

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of their powers under Sections 12, 3,4
19, 32, 35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 117 and 124
(1} {c) & (d) to the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers hereby make the
above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the 1 day of November
2010 and amends the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones
Consolidation Order 2008, as amended, as follows:-

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:
PART 10~ INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part 2 No Loading/Unloading
After existing Part 2.12 add new Parts to the Index as follows:

2.13 | Monday to Friday 8am to 9am and 3pm to 6pm
2.14 | Monday to Saturday 8am to 9.30 and 4pm to 6pm

~NO

Part 3 Mo Stopping Restrictions
Part 3.1 Delete the existing description and substitute the following:
Monday to Friday 8.30am-9.30am and 2pm-4pm on School Entrance Markings except

August

Part 8 Car Club Parking Places
Part 8.3 Streercar Car Club only At Any Time:
Add the lecters “H" in the column headed "CPZL’s”

- Part 12 Loading Bays
Part 12.13 Monday to Sunday 9am to 8pm:
Add the letter "M" in the column headed “CPZ’s"

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

For each of the Controlled Parking Zones identified in Schedule | change the

heading of Part 3.1 to read:
“Monday to Friday 8.30am-9.30am and 2pm-4pm on School Entrance

Marlkings except August”

Controlled Parking Zone &

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new Item 2b: Compton Road — West side - From the boundary wall between
Nos. 13 & I5 Compton Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres



Add new Item 4a: Kingsley Road — East side - from the northern boundary of
property No 2| southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Controlled Parking Zone C

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Amend {tem | Ardingly Street: delete “15 metres” and substitute “10 metres”,
delete “5.5 metres” and substitute *1] metres”

Amend ltem 2 St James's Avenue: delete “7 metres” and substitute "7.5 metres”

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only At Any Time
Renumber existing Item | Devonshire Place as ltem 2

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new ltem 4a: Evelyn Terrace — South side — From a point 15.3 metres west of
the western kerbline of Olivier Close westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Add new Item |9a: Hereford Street — South side — From the eastern boundary wall
of No.l |a westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Delete ltem 32: Old Steine

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing item 3: Blaker Street

Add new ltem 3: Blaker Street — East side — From the boundary wall between Nos.
|4 & 16 Blaker Street northwards for a distance of 3 metres

Part 13.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Amend ltem | Queens Park Terrace: delete 27 metres” and substitute “24.5
metres”, delete “11 metres” and substitute *15.5 metres”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Amend ltem 2 Park Street: delete “9 metres” and substitute 14 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend ftem 71 Old Steine: in column (3) delete “excluding The Glass Pavilion &
Nos. 2-3". In column (4) delete “The Glass Pavilion & Nos. 2-3 - Car Free”

Amend ltem 78 Princes Street: in column (3) insert “excluding The Glass Pavilion &
Nos. 2-3". In column (4) insert “The Glass Pavilion & Nos. 2-3 - Car Free”

Controlled Parking Zone H

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and
8pm inclusive

Add new ltem 9a: Bowring Way — West side — From a point 3 metres north of the
northern kerbline of the access step to Flats Nos. [3 to 59 Bowring Way
northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres



Add new ltem 9b: Bowring Way — Central West side — From a point 2 metres south
of the prolongation of the northern kerbline of the access steps to Flats No.s I3 to
59 Bowring Way northwards for a distance of 3.9 metres

Add new ltem 9c: Bowring Way — Central East side — From a point 15.8 metres east
& north of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Bowring Way northwards for

a distance of 9.5 metres

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay and
Display Parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, ne retuin within 4 hours)

Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm
Amend Item 20 Rock Street: delete “to a point 12 metres west of the junction with

Rock Grove” and substitute “for a distance of 49.5 metres”

Add new ltem 20a: Rock Street — South side — From a point 53.7 metres east of the
western boundary wall of No.1 Rock Street eastwards for a distance of 5.4 metres

Amend ltem 27 St George's Road: delete “westwards” and substitute “eastwards”

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours)

from Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm
Amend Item 16 Chesham Road: delete “to a point level with the western boundary
of No.l Rock Street” and substitute “for a distance of | | metres”

Add new [tem [6a: Chesham Road — South side — From a point 25.2 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Chichester Place eastwards for a distance of 10 metres

Add new ltem 16b: Chesham Road — South side — From a point 39.9 metres east of
che eastern kerbline of Chichester Place eastwards for a distance of 38 metres

Add new ltem l6c: Chesham Road — South side — From the western boundary of
No.| Rock Street westwards for a distance of 19.3 metres

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete ltem |: Chesham Road

Renumber existing Item 2 Chesham Road as Item | and amend description : delete
“13 metres” and substitute “14 metres”

Renumber existing ltem 3 Eastern Terrace as Item 2 and amend description: delete
“12.5 metres” and substitute “7.4 metres” delete “5.5 metres” and substitute “6.6

metres”

After Part 8.2 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only At Any Time

Ref . _r Order
No. Road Name | Side Description Date

From a point 4.9 metres east of the
eastern lerbline of Sudeley Place
eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

St George's | North

l Road side




Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new ltem 41a: Marine Square — East side — From a point 4.7 metres south of the
boundary wall between Nos. 6 & 7 Marine Square northwards for a distance of 6.6
metres

Part 13.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Amend [tem 2 Paston Place: delete "6 metras"” and substitute “6.6 metres” delete

“30 metres” and substitute “32.5 metres”

Controlled Parking Zone |

Part 8.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend ltem 4 New England Road: in column (3) insert “Excluding No.33". In
column {4) insert “No.33 Car free development”

Controlled Parking Zone M

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only at any time
Renumber existing lteam | Holland Road as Item 2

Renumber existing Item 2 Holland Road as Item 3

Add new ltem |: Brunswick Square — North side — From a point 9.3 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Brunswicle Place eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 9. Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem 14 Brunswick Terrace: delete “67.1 metres” and substitute “60.5
metres”, delete “'6.6 metres” and substitute "13.2 metres” {ofs 24/25)

Delete [tam 23: Lansdowne Street

Part 12.6 Loading Only from Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm
Delete ltem 2: Western Road

Delete ltemn 3: YWestern Road

Afcer Part 1 2.7 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 12.13
Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 8pm
liR\If. Road Name | Side Description %ri:r
From a point 24.3 metres north of the
East northern kerbline of Western Road
| | Holland Road cide northwards for a distance of 16

metres

From a point 6.5 metres north of the
VWaterloo East ;
2 . northern kerbline of Chapel Mews
Street side ,
northwards for a distance of 8 metres




Part 13.1 Taxi Ranl At Any Time
Amend Item | Brunswick Place: delete “10.3 metres” and substitute “6.6 metres’
delete “42.5 metres” and substitute * 40.2 metres”

Amend ltem 2 Church Road: delete 7.5 metres” and substitute “10.8 metres’
delete 7 metres” and substitute ‘6 metres”

Controlled Parking Zone N

Part 4.1 Permit Parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am-8pm

inclusive
Amend Item 9 Connaught Terrace: delete “whole description” and substitute ™ East

side — From a point 53.7 metres north of the northern kerbfine of Stirling Place
northward for a distance of 10 metres”

Add new ltem 9a; Connaught Terrace: East side — From a point 39.5 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Blatchington Road southwards for a distance of 39 metres

Amend ltem 10 Connaught Terrace: delete”"whole description” and substitute “West
side — From a point 21.6 metres north of the northern kerbline of Stirling Place
northwards for a distance of 85.3 metres

Amend ltem 9! Tisbury Road (West): delete “From a point 4.3m north of the party
wall of nos. 16 and 18 Tisbury Road and a point 13.3m south of the southern

ierbline of Eaton Road” and substitute:
“From a point 83.7 metres north of the northern kerbline of Church Road to a
point |3.3m south of the southern kerbline of Eaton Road”

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Sunday between %am to 8pm inclusive

Amend ltem 7 Connaught Terrace: delete “53.4 metres” and substitute “41 metres”

Add new ltem 7a: Connaught Terrace — West side — From a point 13.8 metres south
of the southern kerbline of Blatchington Road southwards for a distance of 28.6
metres :

Part 5.11 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 9 hours) Monday to Friday between
%am to épm inclusive

Amend [tem 5 Conway Street (east/west section) — south side: insert “westwards
for a distance of 20.1 metres” after “Conway Street (north/south section)”

Part 6.1 Exclusive Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to
Saturday between 9am and épm inclusive

Delete ltem |2: Connaught Terrace

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete existing Item 1: The Drive

Delete existing ltem 2: Eaton Villas



Renumber existing ltem 3 Ventnor Villas as Item | and amend description: delete “10
metres” and substitute 6.6 metres”

Add new ltem 2: Ventnor Villas — VWest side from a point 9.6 metres north of the
southern boundary of Na.! Ventnor Villas northwards for a distance of 5.5m

Renumber existing ltem 4 Wilbury Road as Item 3 and amend description: delete "'79
metres” and substitute “78 metres”, delete |0 metres” and substitute “6.6 metres”

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only at any time
Renumber existing ltem | Station Approach as ltem 2

Renumber existing ltem 2 Wilbury Road as item 3

Add new ltem |: Osborne Villas — East side — From a point |0 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Church Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem {5 Connaught Terrace: delete 5.5 metres” and substitute “6.6 metres”

Add new ltemn 33a: Goldstone Villas — East side — From a point 46.9 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Station Approach southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Add new ltem 62a: Stirling Place — North side — From a point 21.2 metres east of the
castern kerbline of Brooker Street eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Part 1§.1 Motorcycle only at any time
Amend Item 16 Connaught Terrace: delete “2.8 metres” and substitute “3.7 metres”

Part [2.2 Loading Only 24 hours of any day (for up to a period of 30
minutes, no return within | hour) residential roads

Add new item |2 ; Western Road — South side from a point 2.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of the western arm Palmeira Square westwards for a distance of |8
metres”

Part 3.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Renumber existing [tem | Eaton Road as ltem 2 and amend description: delete “16.1
metres” and substitute 15 metres”

Add new ltem 1: Church Road — North side- From a point 5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Wilbury Road eastwards for 10.7 metres,

Renumber existing ltem 2 Goldstone Vitlas as Item 3
Renumber existing ltem 3 Goldstone Villas as ltem 4
Renumber existing ltem 4 Kingsway as ltem 5

Renumber existing item 5 Norton Road as Item 6 and amend description: delete
“37.23 metres" and substitute “36.5 metres”



Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Amend ltem | Seafield Road: delete “3.8 metres” and substitute 1.3 metres” delete

“7 metres” and substitute “12 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend ltem 55 Sackville Road: in column (3) delete “No.41" and substitute
“No. 141", delete “No.43" and substitute “No. 143"

Amend ltem 82 Wilbury Road: in column (3) insert “excluding No.5 & No.7 ™. In
column (4) insert "No.5 & No.7 Car free development”

Controlled Parking Zone O

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new ltem 252; Palmeira Avenue — West side — From a point 12,9 metres north
of the common boundary of nos. 27 & 29 Palmeira Avenue northwards for 8 metres

Add new Item 27a; Somerhifl Road — East side — From a point [4.| metres south of
the southern kerbline of the access road to the bungalows southwards for a distance
of 6.6 metres

Delete ltem 37: The Upper Drive

Part 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Add new ltem 19a: Granville Road — North side — From a point 6.1 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Osmond Road eastwards for a distance of 3 metres

Amend ltem 31 Montefiore Road: delete “2.7 metres” and substitute “3 metres”.

Part 14.] Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Amend ltem 2 Holland Road: delete “8 metres” and substitute 6,6 metres”

Amend Item 4 Montefiore Road: delete *|.4 metres” and substitute “0.8 metres”

Delete Item 5: Palmeira Avenue

Part 15.1 Police Parking Bays At Any Time
Amend Item | Holland Road: delete *37 metres” and substitute “23.5 metres”,
delete “22 metres” and substitute “33 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend ltem 38 Somerhill Avenue: in column (3) insert “Southdown House, 4 -8
Somerhill Avenue” In column (4) insert “Southdown House, Nos. 4 to 8 Somerhill

Avenue (Car Free)"”

Amend ltam 39 Somerhill Road: in column (3) delete “Excluding Nos. 4 to 8 & No.
|5 (Car Free Development)”. In column (4) delete “Nos. 4 to 8 & No. 15 {Car
Free)"



Controlled Parking Zone ©Q

After Part 1.4 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 2.13
No Loading/unloading Monday to Friday 8am to 9am and 3p to 6pm
Ee: Road Name | Side Description %r:tzr
From a point 44 metres north of the
| ! Dyke Road East | northern kerbline of Port Hall Road
side | northwards for a distance of 46
metres

Part 3.1 Monday to Friday 8.30am-9.30am and 2pm-4pm on School
Entrance Markings except August

Add new ltem é: Stanford Road — VVest side — From the property boundary of Nos.
é1 and 63 Stanford Road southwards for a distance of 25.5 metres.

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and
8pm inclusive

Amend ltem 23 Stanford Road: delete “and a point | metre north of the southern
property boundary of No. §1 Stanford Road” and substitute “southwards to the
property boundary of Nos. 61 and 63 Stanford Road”

Part 5.1Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Sunday between $am to 8pm inclusive

Amend ltem [ Stanford Road: delete “whole description” and substitute “From a
point 25.5 metres scuth of the property boundary of Nos. 61 and 63 Stanford Road
southwards for a distance of 60.2 metres”

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete ltem |: Chatsworth Road

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem | Belmont: delete “21.5 metres” and substitute "26.5 metres”, delete
“16.2 metres” and substitute *11.2 metres

Part 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend |tem 17 Stanford Road: delete “VVest side' and substitute “ East side”, insert

“opposite” between “point” and “1.5 metres”

Part I8.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Delete ltem 12a: New England Road

Controlied Parking Zone R

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem | Aymer Road: delete “26.7 metres" and substitute "' 19.8 metres"
delete “5.5 metres” and substitute “20.6 metres”

Amend ltem 2 Saclwville Gardens; delete 5 metres™ and substitute “5.4 metres”



Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new ltem 9b: Carlisle Road - East side — From the boundary wall between Nos.
19 & 21 northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (ofs No.21)

Delete tem 56: Portland Road

Add new ltem 69a: Rutland Gardens — East side — From the boundary wall between
Nos. 5| & 53 northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (o/s No.53)

Add new ltem 72a: Sackville Gardens — West side — From a point 3.3 metres north
of the common boundary of Nos. 20 and 22 Sackville Gardens southwards for a

distance of B metres

Add new ltem 76a: Sackville Road — West side — From a point 46 metres north of
the northern kerbline of New Church Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres

Delete Item 82: Shelley Road
Delete Item 96: Westbourne Gardens

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing ltem 65: Westbourne Street

Add new ltem 65: Westbourne Street — East side — From a point 24.6 metres south
of the southern kerbline of Portland Road southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Part 13.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Amend item | Rutland Gardens: delete 8.5 metres” and substitute “15 metres”,
delete “24 metres” and substitute “20.8 metres”

Amend item 2 Portiand Road: delete 2.1 metres” and substitute “6.6 metres”,
delate “13 metres” and substitute |5 metres”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete ltem 1: Aymer Road

Delete ltem 3: Saclyville Gardens
Delete ltem 4: Sackvilie Road

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend Item 24 Molesworth Road: delete “Road” and substitute “Street”

Controlled Parking Zone T

Part 7.4 Doctors Parking Monday to Friday 8.30 to 6pm
Amend Item | Hartington Vilias: delete *19.7 metres” and substitute “21.1 metres”

Controlled Parking Zone U

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete ltem 8: St Luke's Terrace



Controlied Parking Zone Y

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm
Delete Item |6a: North Road

Add new |tem 22a: Victoria Road — South side from a point 3 metres west of the
western kerbline of Clifton Terrace, westwards for a distance of 7.8 metres.

Part 2.1 No Loading At Any Time
Amend ltem 6 Francis Street: delete “a point 10 metres east of ”

Part 2.9 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8am- 9.30am and 4.30-6pm
Add ltem 15a: London Road — East side — From the northern kerbline of Francis
Street northwards to the southern kerbline of Marshalls Row

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete [tem |: Buckingham Road

Renumber existing item 2 Church Street as ltem |

Renumber existing Item 3 Gloucester Street as Item 2 and amend description: delete
“4 metres” and substitute “5 metres”, delete “{2 metres” and substitute *10
metres”

Add new ltem 3: Victoria Road — North side from a point 10.8 metres west of the
western kerbline of Powis Road westwards for a distance of 6.5 metres,

Part 7.3 Doctors Parking Monday to Saturday 8am to 7pm
Amend ltem 2 Clifton Road: delete 6 metres"” and substitute “5.4 metres"”

Delete Item 4: Victoria Road

Part 12.]1 Loading Only At Any Time

Amend item |0 North Road: delete “VWhole description” and substitute “North side
— From a point 4 metres east of the eastern kerbline of Queens Gardens eastwards
for a distance of || metres”

Add new {tem |10a: North Road - North side — From a point 20 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Queens Gardens eastwards for a distance of [0 metres.

Add new ltem 28: Regent Street — East side — From a point 25.3 metres north of the
narthern kerbline of Church Street northwards for a distance of 1 [ metres

Part |3.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Amend ltem | Gloucester Place: delete | metre” and substitute “1.7 metres” delete

“10 metres” and subscituee 1| metres”

Amend [tem 2 London Road: delete “3 metres” and substitute 2 metres” delete ¥ ||
metres” and substitute 1 0.5 metres”

10



Amend ltem 4 New England Street: delete existing description and substitute “'From
a point |.5 metres south of the prolongation of the southern kerbline of Ann Street

southwards for a distance of 10 metres”

Amend ltem 5 St Peter’s Place: delete “|2 metres” and substitute “13 metres”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time

Amend item | Buckingham Road: delete “opposite the property boundary of nos.

1 1/12 Buckingham Road" and substitute “9.1 metres north of the northern kerbline
of Upper Gloucester Road”, delete “13 metres” and substitute 17 metres”

Amend ltem 2 Windlesham Avenue: delete “4 metres” and substitute “5.3 metres”
delete 24 metres” and substitute “14.5 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend ltem 76 New England Street: in column (3) delete “Excluding No.33". In
column (4) delete “No.33 (Car Free)”

Controlled Parking Zone £
Part 2.1 No Loading At Any Time
Add new lrem 6a: Castle Street - East and South sides - From a point {6 metres

north of the northern boundary of No.39 Castle Street southwards then westwards
to a point 10 metres east of the east property boundary of No.30 Castle Street

Add new ltem 6b: Castle Street - West and North sides - From the southern
kerbline of Stone Street southwards then westwards to a point |1 metres east of the

eastern property boundary of No.8 Castle Street

Add new ltem 31b: Stone Street — South side — From the western kerbline of Castle
Street, westwards for a distance of 6 metres

Add new ltem 3 lc: Stone Street — North side - From the western kerbline of Castle
Street, westwards for a distance of 6 metres

Part 2.2 No Loading 8am to { Ipm
Delete Item 3: Western Road

Amend ltem 5 Woestern Road: delete ““37.5 metres” and substitute 36 metres'”
Amend ltem 10 Western Road: delete “eastwards” and substitute “westwards”
Part 2.4 No Loading 8am to 9.30am and 1| am to 6pm

Amend ltem | Western Road: delete “89 metres” and substitute “85 metres”, delete

“a point 25 metres east of the eastern” and substitute “the western”

Part 2.6 No Loading Monday to Saturday 9am - 6pm
Delete item 8: Castle Street

Dealete ltem 9: Castle Street

Delete ltem | 1: Castle Street

11



Delete ltem 25; Stone Street

After Part 2.10 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:

Part 2.14
No Loading/unloading Monday to Saturday 8am to 9.30am and 4pm to
épm
Ililif: Road Name | Side Description %rizr
From the eastern kerbline of its
l Western North | junction with Montpelier Road
Road side | eastwards for a distance of 86
metres

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between $am and
Bpm inclusive

Amend ltem 7a Bedford Square: delete "2 metres east of the western boundary of
Bedford Square™ and substitute” | 1.4 metres east of the eastern kerbline of the
western arm of Bedford Square”, delete 5.2 metres” and substitute ‘5.4 metres”

Part I{.] Motorcycles only At Any Time

Amend item 4 Bedford Square: delete whole description and substitute “ from a
point | .4 metres west of the western kerbline of the eastern arm of Bedford
Square eastwards for a distance of 5.4 metres”

Add new ltem 27a: Sillwood Street — South side — From a point 8.9 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Western Street eastwards for a distance of 3 metres

Part 13.] Taxi Ranlc At Any Time
Amend ltem | East Street: delete "4 metres” and substitute “{2.5 metres”, delete
“34 metres" and substitute “35.5 metres”

Amend ltem 2 East Street; delete "4 metres” and substitute *'16.5 metres”, delete
“15 metres" and substitute “13.5 metres”

Amend Iterm 3 East Street: delete "7 metres’ and substitute 25 metres”, delete
Castle Square' and substitute “"North Street”, delete “33 metres™ and substitute
*36.4 metres”

Amend ltem 4 Norfolk Road: delete "3 metres” and substitute “6.7 metres”, delete
“southern property boundary of no.52 Norfolk Road™ and substitute “northern

kerbline of VWestern Road”

Amend ltem 5 Pool Valley: delete “13 metres” and substitute *12.3 metres”, delete
“10.7 metres” and substitute 9.3 metres”

Amend |tem 6 Pool Valley: delete “14 metres” and substitute “] 1.2 metres”

Delete ltern 7: Preston Street

12



Add new Item 7: Queens Square — Centre west — From a point 5.2 metres south of
the property boundary of nos. /10 & |1 Queens Square southwards for a distance

of 29 metres

Armend ltem 8 Queens Square: insert “east” after “centre”, delete “adjacent to” and
substitute “5.2 metres south of”, insert “and 11" after “nos. 9/10”, delete “33
metres” and substitute “34 metres”

Amend Item 9 Queens Square: delete “|5 metres” and substitute “16.5 metres”,
delete 18 metres” and substitute “16.5 metres™

Amend ltem | | West Street: insert “5.3 metres south of the prolongation of” after
“From a point”, delete “25 metres” and substitute "33 metres”

Amend ltem Western Street: delete “Whale description” and substitute “From a
point 2.8 metres north of the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a

distance of 8.2 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits

Amend ltem 27 Castle Street: in column (3) delete “Excluding development of 2
residential units at the ex Brighton Corporation Depot access between No.s 35 & 36
" In column (4) delete “development of 2 residential units at the ex Brighton
Corporation Depot access between No.s 35 & 36 (Car Free)”

Schedule | Amendments & Revocations:

The items specified below which were included in the Brighton & Hove Various
Controlled Parking Zones Consolidation Order 2008 Amendment Order No.| 3
2009, under the Part numbers identified, are hereby amended or revoked:

Zone M

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, with no return within 4
hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm inclusive

Renumnber the second new ltem 16 “Lansdowne Place - East side — 60° Echelon
Parking. From a point 32.3 metres north of the northern kerbline of Brunswick
Terrace northwards for a distance [0.8 metres — (CPZ) “M” “ as ltem [6a

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend “Amend Item 12 Brunswick Street West” to “Amend Item |3 Brunswick

Street West”

Zone N

Part 5.1] Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 9 hours) Monday to Friday between

9am to 6pm inclusive
Renumber the second new Item 3 “Conway Street (east/west section) — North side

- from a point 109.2 metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of
Conway Street (north/south section) eastwards for a distance of 22 metres) — (CPZ)

IIN‘! [ as item 3a

13



Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete “Delete Item 2 Eaton Gardens"

Part 7.2 Doctors Parking 8am - 8pm on any day
Amend “Add ltem |: Eaton Gardens —~ North side” to “Add item |: Eaton Villas —
MNorth side”

Part il.I Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend “Amend ltem 9 Brooker Street” to “Amend ltem 8 Brooker Street”

The items specified below which were included in the Brighton & Hove Various
Controlled Parking Zones Consolidation Order 2008 Amendment Order No.3 2010
under the Part numbers identified, are hereby amended or revoked:

Zone C

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time

Amend “Delete ltem 3: Somerset Street ~ South side” to “Delete ltem 4: Somerset
Street— South side™

Zone O

Part 1. Motorcycles only At Any Time

Renumber new ltem 55 “Wilbury Crescent — North side — From a point 6.3 metres
west of the western kerbline of Bigwood Avenue westwards for a distance of 3
metres — (CPZ) “O" “ as ltem 56

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON )
& HOVE CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this )

28" day of QOctobey  Two Thousand and Ten )
in the presence of

&l -

Authorised Officer

BN gl

14



